
Appendix 1 
Functions of government organizations and 
related agencies 

A summary organization chart of the federal government appears in Chapter 4. A detailed chart is available 
from Information Canada. 

Agricultural Products Board, The Agricultural Products Board was established under authority of the 
Emergency Powers Act by Order in Council PC 3415 of July 31, 1951, to administer contracts with other 
countries to buy, or sell, agricultural products, and to carry out other commodity operations as considered 
necessary or desirable as determined by Canada's needs and requirements. The Board was re-established 
under the Agricultural Products Board Act in 1952 and operates now under RSC 1970, c.A-5. 

The Board is a part of the Canada Department of Agriculture. 

Agricultural Stabilization Board, Established in 1958 as a Crown corporation under the Agricultural 
Stabilization Act (RSC 1970, c.A-9), the Board is empowered to stabilize prices of agricultural products 
both to assist the industry in realizing fair returns for labour and investment and to maintain a fair 
relationship between the prices received by farmers and the costs of goods and services that they buy. 
Programs under the Act are administered by Board staff with assistance from the Canada Department of 
Agriculture. The Board reports to Parliament through the Minister of Agriculture. 

Air Canada, Formerly Trans-Canada Air Lines, Air Canada was incorporated by Act of Parliament in 1937 
(RSC 1970, c.A-11) to provide a publicly owned air transportation service, with powers to carry on its 
business throughout Canada and outside Canada. The corporation now maintains passenger, mail and 
commodity traffic services over nation-wide routes as well as services to the United States, Britain, Ireland, 
Belgium, France, Switzerland, the Federal Republic of Germany, Austria, Denmark, the USSR, 
Czechoslovakia, Bermuda, the Bahamas, Jamaica, Antigua, Barbados and Trinidad. Air Canada is 
responsible to Parliament through the Minister of Transport. 

Anti-dumping Tribunal. Under the Anti-dumping Act (RSC 1970, c.A-15, as amended by SC 1970-71, c.3), 
the Anti-dumping Tribunal is declared to be a court of record and makes formal inquiry into the impact of 
dumping on production in Canada. Within 90 days of a preliminary determination of dumping by the 
Deputy Minister of National Revenue for Customs and Excise, the Tribunal must make an order or finding 
on the question of injury, threat of injury or material retardation to production in Canada of like goods. 
Decisions of the Tribunal are final and conclusive except as provided for under Section 28 of the Federal 
Court Act (SC 1970, c. 1). In addition, the Governor in Council may request the Tribunal to investigate and 
report on any matter relative to the importation of goods into Canada that may cause or threaten injury to 
the production of any goods in this country. 

The Tribunal consists of a chairman and not more than four other members. Its offices are located in 
Ottawa and it may conduct hearings in other centres in Canada. The Tribunal reports to Parliament 
through the Minister of Finance. 

Army Benevolent Fund Board. The Army Benevolent Fund Board, established by the Army Benevolent 
Fund Act (RSC 1970, c.A-16), administers the Army Benevolent Fund, a special account set up in the 
Consolidated Revenue Fund. The Board awards grants from the special account to veterans or their 
dependants for relief, if none is available from government sources, and for educational assistance, 
contingent on need and continued progress. The Board has five members appointed by the Governor in 
Council, one of whom is nominated by the Royal Canadian Legion and one by the National Council of 
Veterans Associations in Canada. Head office is in Ottawa. The Board reports to Parliament through the 
Minister of Veterans Affairs. 

Atlantic Development Council, Created under the 1969 Government Organization Act (SC 1968/69, c.28), 
the Atlantic Development Council is composed of 11 members representative of the area appointed by the 
Governor in Council to advise the Minister of Regional Economic Expansion on plans and policies for 
economic expansion and social adjustment in the Atlantic Provinces, and to carry out feasibility studies and 
evaluate policies or programs submitted within the framework of an over-all strategy for the development 
of the region. 

The Council reports to Parliament through the Minister of Regional Economic Expansion. 

Atomic Energy Control Board. By Act of Parliament (RSC 1970, c.A-19) proclaimed October 1946, the 
regulation and control of atomic energy in Canada was placed under the Atomic Energy Control Board. 
The Board reports to Parliament through the Minister of Energy, Mines and Resources. 

Atomic Energy of Canada Limited. This Crown company was incorporated in February 1952 under the 
Atomic Energy Control Act, 1946 (RSC 1970, c.A-19) to take over from the National Research Council on 
April 1, 1952 the operation of the Chalk River project. The main activities of the company are: the 
development of economic nuclear power; scientific research and development in the atomic energy field; 


